
Come and See

The Shocking Truth

(John 1:35-42)



Matthew 6:33, “But seek ye first the kingdom 
of God, and his righteousness; and all these 
things shall be added unto you.”



1. Shocking truth: Jesus Christ is the Lamb of 
God (Vs 35-36).



2 Corinthians 5:21, “For he hath made him to 
be sin for us, who knew no sin; that we might 
be made the righteousness of God in him.”



Revelation 21:4, “And God shall wipe away all 
tears from their eyes; and there shall be no 
more death, neither sorrow, nor crying, 
neither shall there be any more pain: for the 
former things are passed away.”



2. Shocking truth: When confronted with 
Christ the search is over (Vs. 37-39).



Acts 4:12, “Neither is there salvation in any 
other: for there is none other name under 
heaven given among men, whereby we must 
be saved.”



Luke 9:58, “Foxes have holes, and birds of the 
air have nests; but the Son of man hath not 
where to lay his head.”



3. Shocking Truth: When you Know Christ, you 
share Christ (Vs. 40-42).



I John 4:20, “If a man say, I love God, and 
hateth his brother, he is a liar: for he that 
loveth not his brother whom he hath seen, 
how can he love God whom he hath not 
seen?”



4. Shocking Truth: When you know Christ, He 
will change you (Vs. 42).



2 Corinthians 5:17, “Therefore if any man be
in Christ, he is a new creature: old things are 
passed away; behold, all things are become 
new.”


